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Filip Lipiński

EXTENDED DEADLINE! 20.1.2025.

Rethinking Architecture. Contemporary Perspectives of Architectural Studies and Its Histories.

Artium Quaestiones concentrates on theoretical and methodological problems issues inof art his-
tory. Thesey usually have been discussed in our journal primarily with reference to visuality, image
science/image studies (Bildwissenschaft) or the issues related tof visual media. This timeNow,
without not giving up on our interest in new scholarly tendencies and theoretical studies, we have
decided to take have a closer look at new methods and theories of studying architecture and their
histories. We invite scholars to consider to what extent cultural/theoretical turns in the humani-
ties, which have been assimilated by art history since the 1970s, have also been influential in the
field of architectural studies. We would like to see how these methodological/theoretical perspec-
tives,  practisced  for  several  decades  now,  stimulate  the  rethinking  of  diverse  various  old
problems of history of architecture and the formulating of new research questions and objectives.
The theme of the next issue refers to numerous anthologies devoted to philosophy and historiog-
raphy of architecture, for instance Rethinking Architecture: A Reader in Cultural Theory (1997) or
Rethinking Architectural Historiography (2006). We hope that the new attempt at “rethinking”
these questions will specify the position of architecture and the possibilities of studying it within
the history of art. We invite scholars to submit article proposals without imposing any chronologi-
cal or geographical limitations. However, we are particularly interested in the following issues:

- Architecture as an image (architecture in studies on visual culture studies, ‘un-built’ architecture)
- Between material structure and senses (architecture and “thing studies”, new materialism and
the sensorial turn)
- Functions of architecture and practices of the everyday (architecture and cultural studies of
everyday life)
Architecture and social art histories (architecture in the face of social stratification, the “ludic
turn”, gender politics)
- Architectural geographies and globalization (architecture and regional and postcolonial/decolo-
nial studies)
Historiography of architecture (architecture and forms of historical narratives)

The deadline for submissions (abstracts not longer than 2500 characters and a short academic
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bio): 15 December 2024 (extended until 20 January 2025). The aAuthors of the selected propos-
als that are selected will be asked to deliver a full text of maximum 45000 characters (including
references and bibliography) by 25 February 2025. All texts, after receiving a they have been posi-
tively evaluation fromed by the editorial team, all texts will undergo be subject tothe process of a
double-blind peer-review. Article proposals should be sent by mail to: aq.redakcja@amu.edu.pl
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